

**Park District of Highland Park
2018 Athletic Field Prep & Turf Materials RFP
as opened only - 5/7/18**

Product	National Seed	Reinders	SiteOne Landscape Supply	ConservFS	Valley Athletics
Group A: Turface	no bid	\$258 / no Gamesaver	\$563.60	\$643.20	no bid
Group A alternate: Green Calcined Clay	no bid	no bid	\$420.40	\$414.00	no bid
Group A Total	no bid	\$258.00	\$984.00	\$1,057.20	no bid
Group B: Pros Choice	\$1,003.20	\$1,014.00	no bid	no bid	\$1,310.00
Group B alternate: Green Calcined Clay	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$602.00
Group B Total	\$1,003.20	\$1,014.00	no bid	no bid	\$1,912.00
Group C: Soccer Paint - Buckets	\$1,594.00	\$1,598.00	\$1,276.40	\$1198 - not dilution rate spec	\$1,400.00
Group D: Athletic Paint - Cans	\$5,158.80	no bid	\$3,745.80	\$4,047.36	\$3,780.00
Group E: Ballfield Chalk	\$615.00	\$757.50	\$787.50	\$658.50	no bid
Group F: Grass Seed	\$6,260.00	\$5,625.00	\$5,063.90	\$5,895.00	no bid
Group G: Peat Moss	\$615.00	no bid	\$569.40	\$566.40	no bid
Group H: Mound & Plate Clay	\$1,375.00	\$1,518.00	\$1,277.00	\$1,150.00	no bid
Delivery Charge	\$30.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$75.00	\$0.00