

Company Name	Address	1. DCRC - Shingle Roof - Base Bid Item #1	1. DCRC - Shingle Roof -Base Bid Item #2	2. DCRC - EPDM Roof -Base Bid Item #1	2. DCRC - EPDM Roof -Base Bid Item #2	3. Recreation Center- Base Bid Item #1A	3. Recreation Center- Base Bid Item #1B	3. Recreation Center- Base Bid Item #1C	3. Recreation Center- Base Bid Item #1D	3. Recreation Center - Base Bid Total	3. Recreation Center - Base Bid Item #2	3. Recreation Center - Base Bid Item #3	3. Recreation Center - Base Bid Item #4	1 DCRC - Shingle Roof Alternate Item #1	1 DCRC - Shingle Roof Alternate Item #2	1 DCRC - Shingle Roof Alternate Item #3	1 DCRC - Shingle Roof Alternate Item #4
TOP Roofing	2206 N Main Street, Suite 204, Wheaton, Il. 60187	\$162,225.00	\$1.25/LF	\$147,400.00	\$12.00/LF	\$1,680.00	\$15,000.00	\$1,890.00	\$1,200.00	\$19,000.00	\$2.50/SF	\$1.25/LF	\$1.50/SF	NA	NA	NA	\$2,000.00
Weatherguard Roofing	345 Renner Drive, Elgin, Il. 60123	\$180,000.00	\$8.90/LF	\$177,000.00	\$20.00/LF	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$50,000.00	\$15,700.00	\$5.00/SF	\$3,400.00
Red Feather Group	711 Becker Road, Glenview, Il. 60025	\$141,690.00	\$18.00/LF	\$248,250.00	\$18.00/LF	\$3,600.00	\$7,500.00	\$2,500.00	\$1,500.00	\$15,100.00	\$4.00/SF	\$18.00/LF	\$4.50/SF	\$39,000.00	\$52,000.00	\$4.50/SF	\$13,500.00
All American Exterior Solutions	150 Oakwood Road, Lake Zurich, Il 60047	\$199,000.00	\$12.00/LF	\$197,000.00	\$15.00/LF	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$54,000.00	\$43,600.00	\$3.00/SF	\$3,500.00
DCG Roofing Solutions, Inc.	2045 Janice Avenue, Melrose Park, Il. 60160	\$258,000.00	\$7.50/LF	\$217,380.00	\$20.00/LF	\$7,896.00	\$26,152.00	\$11,648.00	\$6,832.00	\$52,528.00	\$18.00/SF	\$18.00/LF	\$11.00/SF	\$87,360.00	\$43,950.00	\$6.00/SF	\$4,500.00
Sealtight Exteriors, Inc.	3239 Loverock Avenue, Steger, Il. 60475	\$728,700.00	\$15.00/LF	\$241,150.00	\$15.00/LF	\$4,900.00	\$40,400.00	\$3,600.00	\$2,400.00	\$51,300.00	\$6.00/SF	\$15.00/LF	\$8.50/SF	\$72,000.00	\$44,000.00	\$4.00/SF	\$3,900.00

Note: This bid is not acceptable due to using the wrong bid form/incomplete