

| Company Name                        | Address   | 1. DCRC - Shingle Roof- Base Bid Item #1 | 1. DCRC - Shingle Roof -Base Bid Item #2 | 1. DCRC - Shingle Roof -Base Bid Item #3 | Total Base Bid (Items #1-3) | 1. DCRC - Shingle Roof -Base Bid Item #4 | 1. DCRC - Shingle Roof -Base Bid Item #5 | 2. DCRC - EPDM Roof - Item #1 | 2. DCRC - EPDM Roof - Item #2 | Alternate 1- DCRC - EPDM Roof - Item #1 | Alternate 2- RCHP - Removal/Replacement - Item #1A | Alternate 2- RCHP - Removal/Replacement - Item #1B | Alternate 2- RCHP - Removal/Replacement - Item #1C | Alternate 2- RCHP - Removal/Replacement - Item #1D | Total Alternate #2 - Items #1 A-D | Alternate 2- RCHP - Removal/Replacement - Item #2 | Alternate 2- RCHP - Removal/Replacement - Item #3 | Alternate 2- RCHP - Removal/Replacement - Item #4 |
|-------------------------------------|---|--|--|--|-----------------------------|--|--|-------------------------------|-------------------------------|---|--|--|--|--|-----------------------------------|---|---|---|
| TOP Roofing                         | 2206 N Main Street, Suite 204, Wheaton, Il. 60187 | \$145,000.00                             | \$24,000.00                              | \$33,540.00                              | \$202,540.00                | \$12.00/LF                               | \$3.00/SF                                | \$158,000.00                  | \$12.00/LF                    | \$2,000.00                              | \$2,680.00   | \$15,000.00  | \$1,890.00   | \$1,200.00   | \$19,000.00                       | \$2.50/SF   | \$12.00/LF  | \$3.00/SF   |
| All American Exterior Solutions     | 150 Oakwood Road, Lake Zurich, Il. 60047          | \$197,000.00                             | \$54,000.00                              | \$43,600.00                              | \$294,600.00                | \$18.00/LF                               | \$3.00/SF                                | \$197,000.00                  | \$18.00/LF                    | \$3,500.00                              | No Bid   | No Bid   | No Bid   | No Bid   | No Bid                            | No Bid  | No Bid  | No Bid  |
| Seal Tight Exteriors, Inc.          | 3239 Loverock Avenue, Steger, Il. 60475           | \$196,900.00                             | \$59,400.00                              | \$43,000.00                              | \$299,300.00                | \$12.00/LF                               | \$4.00/SF                                | \$232,000.00                  | \$15.00/LF                    | \$3,400.00                              | \$4,700.00   | \$23,100.00  | \$16,700.00  | Included in #1C                                    | \$44,500.00                       | \$6.00/SF   | \$15.00/LF  | \$8.50/SF   |
| DCG Roofing Solutions, Inc.         | 2045 Janice Avenue, Melrose Park, IL. 60160       | \$229,600.00                             | \$70,448.00                              | \$43,120.00                              | \$343,120.00                | \$8.00/LF                                | \$6.00/SF                                | \$196,900.00                  | \$15.00/LF                    | \$3,500.00                              | \$6,600.00   | \$34,500.00  | \$6,600.00   | \$3,300.00   | \$51,000.00                       | \$16.00/SF  | \$16.00/SF  | \$11.00/SF  |
| J & F Chiattello Construction, Inc. | 1387 Joliet Street, Suite c, Dyer, In. 46311      | \$234,000.00                             | \$45,500.00                              | \$45,500.00                              | \$325,000.00                | \$8.00/LF                                | \$10.00/SF                               | \$450,000.00                  | \$8.00/LF                     | \$3,000.00                              | \$4,800.00   | \$16,000.00  | \$2,400.00   | \$520.00   | \$23,720.00                       | \$2.20/SF   | \$5.20/LF   | \$10.00/SF  |