
Contractor Name
Trees #3, 14, 16, 17, 18 by 

June 17
Trees #1, 2, 4, 5, 6, 7, 9, by 

July 1
Trees #8, 10, 11, 12, 13, 15 by 

July 22
Base Proposal

Alternate #1 - Stump 
Grinding 

Robert Kinnucan Tree 
Experts 

10,800.00$                                14,880.00$                                8,700.00$                                  34,380.00$                                no bid 

SavATree / Nels Johnson 
 proposal available upon 

request  
no bid no bid

 proposal available upon 
request  

no bid 

Bode Tree Care 8,743.00$                                  9,273.00$                                  7,044.00$                                  25,060.00$                                4,740.00$                                  

Clean Cut Tree Service 10,450.00$                                11,325.00$                                9,200.00$                                  30,975.00$                                3,209.25$                                  

Progressive Tree Service 9,430.00$                                  7,830.00$                                  7,460.00$                                  24,720.00$                                1,620.00$                                  

Hendricksen Tree Service 5,328.00$                                  7,648.00$                                  4,576.00$                                  17,552.00$                                1,800.00$                                  

Advanced Tree Care 5,900.00$                                  7,800.00$                                  5,950.00$                                  19,650.00$                                5,400.00$                                  

Park District of Highland Park
2021 June Sunset Woods Tree Removals RFP
Monday, June 13, 2022 @ 5:00pm 
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