
Contractor Name Base Bid
Alternate 1: 

Central
Alternate 2: 

Moroney 
Alternate 3: 

Lincoln
Alternate 4: 

Mooney 
Alternate 5: West 

Ridge 
Alternate 6: May T 

Watts. 

Arborworks                          
Downers Grove, IL

65,870.00$            12,600.00$            4,100.00$              11,500.00$            7,800.00$              4,800.00$              4,200.00$              

McGinty Bros., Inc.                               
Long Grove, IL

24,250.00$            no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 

Homer Tree Service                      
Lockport, IL

39,600.00$            3,600.00$              1,440.00$              4,800.00$              3,000.00$              3,000.00$              2,760.00$              

Nels Johnson SavATree       
Evanston, IL 

16,548.55$            3,102.85$              1,084.29$              3,102.85$              2,068.57$              2,068.57$              1,084.29$              

Robert Kinnucan Tree Experts and 
Landscaping Company, Inc.                
Lake Bluff, IL 

27,050.00$            3,000.00$              800.00$                 4,000.00$              1,800.00$              3,200.00$              1,300.00$              

Balanced Environments, Inc.     Old 
Mill Creek, IL 

58,064.00$            12,606.00$            1,910.00$              6,112.00$              3,820.00$              4,584.00$              2,292.00$              

Clean Cut Tree Services, Inc.      
Grayslake, IL 

17,740.00$            2,860.00$              600.00$                 2,400.00$              1,600.00$              2,070.00$              1,200.00$              
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