
BID/RFP TABULATION

PROJECT TITLE:
BID OPENING DATE:
PROJECT MANAGER:

Base Bid Item Homer Tree Service
Clean Cut Tree 
Service, Inc. Kinnucan

Hendricksen Tree 
Care

Sawvell Tree 
Service and 
Landscape Design

Danny Cunniff Park $5,674.00 $3,500.00 No Bid $3,781.00 $4,500.00

Heller Nature Center (Trees #1-10) $9,860.00 $6,050.00 No Bid $7,842.00 $6,050.00

Old Elm Park $2,684.00 $2,500.00 No Bid $2,420.00 $2,000.00

Port Clinton Park $3,100.00 $3,500.00 No Bid $2,420.00 $2,500.00

Central Park $5,518.00 $5,650.00 No Bid $4,253.00 $5,200.00

Memorial Park $1,644.00 $1,200.00 No Bid $1,172.00 $1,200.00

Sunset Woods Park $10,874.00 $10,950.00 No Bid $8,181.00 $10,350.00

Rosewood Park $1,644.00 $1,500.00 No Bid $924.00 $1,800.00

West Ridge Park $3,516.00 $2,500.00 No Bid $4,350.00 $2,250.00

Moroney Park $1,748.00 $1,100.00 No Bid $964.00 $1,500.00

Total Base Bid $46,262.00 $38,450.00 No Bid $36,307.00 $37,350.00

Alternate Bid Item

Heller Nature Center (Trees #11-12) $2,788.00 $3,980.00 $2,700.00 No Bid $1,600.00

Morain Park $3,776.00 $2,250.00 $2,700.00 No Bid $2,300.00

West Ridge Park Stump Grinding $1,740.00 $400.00 $450.00 No Bid $400.00

2023 Districtwide Fall Tree Removals

Wednesday, September 13, 2023 at 10:00am

Dan Voss
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