BID/RFP TABULATION

PROJECT TITLE: 2025 RCHP Pool Filter Change, Pool Deck Renovation, & Pool Grate Replacement

BID OPENING DATE: Tuesday, March 11, 2025 at 9:00am

PROJECT MANAGER: Ben Kutscheid

Bid Item Mechanical Inc.. dba Helm Schaefges Bros. Inc. Stuckey Construction
Mechanical Company, Inc.
Regenerative Filter 1 - Demolition $22,000.00 $17,000.00 $20,000.00
Regenerative Filter 2 - Supply new filter system $155,000.00 $135,000.00 $152,000.00
Regenerative Filter 3 - Install new filter system and piping $79,000.00 $144,777.00 $111,000.00
Regenerative Filter 4 - Electrical $59,000.00 $20,000.00 $18,000.00
Regenerative Filter 5 - Controls $20,000.00 S5,000.00 (PS) $4,000.00
Regenerative Filter Total $335,000.00 $321,777.00 $305,000.00
VGB Main Drain Grate 1 - VCB main drain grate $1,870.00 (in Bid Amount) $6,300.00 $3,000.00
VGB Main Drain Grate Total|  $4,620.00 (in Bid Amount) $6,300.00 $3,000.00
Deck Tile Replacment 1 - Pool deck tile demolition &
installation No Bid $57,500.00 $103,000.00
Deck Tile Replacment 2 - Pool deck safety strip demolition
& installation No Bid $57,500.00 InT1
Deck Tile Replacement Total No Bid $115,000.00 $103,000.00
Total Base Bid (Filter + Grate + Deck) No Bid S443,077.00 $411,000.00
Alternates
1: Deck Replacement - Pool viewing area $9,170.00 $6,000.00
2: Deck Replacement - Pool managers office $21,500.00 $13,000.00
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